

Arlington Heights Park District
 Fertilizer-Turf Protectants- Grass Seed Bid 2016
RESULTS
 Bid May be Awarded at: **March 8, 2016** Board Meeting

	Conserv FS	Reinders	Tyler	Chicagoland Turf	Pro-Gro Solutions	Arthur Cleason	Site One Landscape Supply
Product							
28 Tons 25-0-10 Bulk Fertilizer	\$30,632.00 includes application	No Bid	\$22,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
319 acres Application 175 lbs. per acre or 11.42 acres		No Bid	\$7,656.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7 Tons 0-0-7 W.20% Merit Bulk Fertilizer	\$6,062.00 includes application	\$4,522.00	\$5,138.00	No Bid	\$4,838.40	\$4,725.00	No Bid
70 acres Applicatopn 200 lbs. per acre at 10 acres		\$2,030.00	\$1,680.00	No Bid	\$1,750.00	\$1,050.00	No Bid
6,000 lbs./ 120 Bags 27-0-12 Midsized Fertilizer	\$2,524.80	No Bid	\$2,640.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,150.00	\$5,949.60
2,000 lbs./50 bags 17-0-17 Contec DG Greens Grade Fertilizer	No Bid	\$2,590.00	No Bid	\$2,590.00	\$2,590.00	\$2,590.00	\$2,500.00 substitute
4 x 21 oz. (1case) Lexicon	\$1,824.48	\$1,824.48	No Bid	\$1,824.48	\$1,824.48	\$1,824.48	\$1,824.48
60 gals Daconil	No Bid	\$2,016.00	No Bid	\$2,388.00	No Bid	\$3,660.00	\$3,660.00
4 gals. Banol	\$299.00	\$1,720.00	No Bid	\$925.00	No Bid	\$1,875.00	\$1,936.92
5 x .49 case (1 case) Emerald	\$739.90	\$1,479.80	No Bid	\$725.00	\$739.90	\$1,479.80	\$739.90
33 lbs Curalan	\$1,198.56	\$1,089.00	No Bid	\$1,090.00	\$1,291.95	\$1,250.96	\$1,058.30
50 Lbs Penncross	\$355.00	\$380.00	\$487.50	\$390.00	\$400.00	\$396.00	\$410.20
1,000 lbs/ 20 bags 0-7 Accelepryn	\$506.00	\$562.00	\$500.00	\$580.00	No Bid	\$535.00	\$491.40

Witness: Sheila Cruz Al Bevers