

**Arlington Heights Park District - 35# - Saddle Stitch**

Company	Season	35#	80# Text Wt. Cover	Saddle Stitch Binding	Delivery Chg	Total		Add'l 500 copies
KK Stevens Publishing Astoria, IL	Fall	14,409.31				14,409.31		167.71
	Winter	11,570.54				11,570.54		141.77
	Spring	12,836.40				12,836.40		154.74
	Summer	14,074.04				14,074.04		167.58
							<b>52,890.29</b>	
Action Printing Fon Dul Lac, WI	Fall	22,807.00				22,807.00		300.00
	Winter	19,367.00				19,367.00		260.00
	Spring	21,024.00				21,024.00		279.00
	Summer	22,807.00				22,807.00		300.00
							<b>86,005.00</b>	
American Litho Milwaukee, WI	Fall	20,748.00				20,748.00		252.00
	Winter	16,714.00				16,714.00		214.00
	Spring	18,272.00				18,272.00		230.00
	Summer	20,265.00				20,265.00		252.00
							<b>75,999.00</b>	
EP Graphics Berne, IN	Fall	18,775.00				18,775.00		260.77
	Winter	15,175.00				15,175.00		223.17
	Spring	16,490.00				16,490.00		238.30
	Summer	18,417.00				18,417.00		263.10
							<b>68,857.00</b>	
CSI Media Delavan, WI	Fall	9,234.00	8,296.00	4,488.00	500.00	22,518.00		135.00
	Winter	8,238.00				8,238.00		120.00
	Spring	8,487.00				8,487.00		124.00
	Summer	9,234.00				9,234.00		135.00
							<b>48,477.00</b>	
Castle Printech DeKalb, IL	Fall	13,795.00				13,795.00		150.00
	Winter	11,365.00				11,365.00		150.00
	Spring	12,455.00				12,455.00		150.00
	Summer	13,490.00				13,490.00		150.00
							<b>51,105.00</b>	

Unless otherwise indicated, the cover, binding and delivery charges are included in the main price.

**Arlington Heights Park District - 35# - Perfect Bind**

Company	Season	35#	80# Text Wt. Cover	Perfect Bind Binding	Delivery Chg	Total	Add'l 500 copies
KK Stevens Publishing Astoria, IL	Fall	19,101.64				19,101.64	\$233.92
	Winter	16,160.44				16,160.44	209.11
	Spring	17,585.59				17,585.59	182.94
	Summer	18,677.99				18,677.99	233.51
						<b>71,525.66</b>	
Action Printing Fon Dul Lac, WI	Fall	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.00	No Bid
	Winter					0.00	
	Spring					0.00	
	Summer					0.00	
						<b>0.00</b>	
American Litho Milwaukee, WI	Fall	25,238.00				25,238.00	252.00
	Winter	20,847.00				20,847.00	214.00
	Spring	22,610.00				22,610.00	230.00
	Summer	24,755.00				24,755.00	252.00
						<b>93,450.00</b>	
EP Graphics Berne, IN	Fall	18,895.00				18,895.00	260.77
	Winter	15,173.00				15,173.00	223.17
	Spring	16,535.00				16,535.00	238.30
	Summer	18,514.00				18,514.00	263.10
						<b>69,117.00</b>	
CSI Media Delavan, WI	Fall	9,234.00	8,296.00	16,268.00	500.00	34,298.00	135.00
	Winter	8,238.00				8,238.00	120.00
	Spring	8,487.00				8,487.00	124.00
	Summer	9,234.00				9,234.00	135.00
						<b>60,257.00</b>	
Castle Printech Dekalb, IL	Fall	17,995.00				17,995.00	150.00
	Winter	14,865.00				14,865.00	150.00
	Spring	15,975.00				15,975.00	150.00
	Summer	17,635.00				17,635.00	150.00
						<b>66,470.00</b>	

Unless otherwise indicated, the cover, binding and delivery charges are included in the main price.

**Arlington Heights Park District - 50# - Perfect Bind**

Company	Season	50#	80# Text Wt. Cover	Perfect Bind Binding	Delivery Chg	Total		Add'l 500 copies
KK Stevens Publishing Astoria, IL	Fall	25,492.29				25,492.29		\$233.92
	Winter	21,134.65				21,134.65		209.11
	Spring	23,363.35				23,363.35		182.94
	Summer	24,901.98				24,901.98		233.51
							<b>94,892.27</b>	
Action Printing Fon Dul Lac, WI	Fall	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.00		No Bid
	Winter					0.00		
	Spring					0.00		
	Summer					0.00		
							<b>0.00</b>	
American Litho Milwaukee, WI	Fall	19,683.00				19,683.00		252.00
	Winter	17,418.00				17,418.00		214.00
	Spring	18,523.00				18,523.00		230.00
	Summer	19,375.00				19,375.00		252.00
							<b>74,999.00</b>	
EP Graphics Berne, IN	Fall	25,788.00				25,788.00		260.77
	Winter	20,775.00				20,775.00		223.17
	Spring	22,707.00				22,707.00		238.30
	Summer	25,242.00				25,242.00		263.10
							<b>94,512.00</b>	
CSI Media Delavan, WI	Fall	15,313.00	8,296.00	16,268.00	500.00	40,377.00		135.00
	Winter	12,720.00				12,720.00		120.00
	Spring	14,028.00				14,028.00		124.00
	Summer	15,313.00				15,313.00		135.00
							<b>82,438.00</b>	
Castle Printech DeKalb, IL	Fall	23,435.00				23,435.00		150.00
	Winter	19,065.00				19,065.00		150.00
	Spring	20,740.00				20,740.00		150.00
	Summer	22,945.00				22,945.00		150.00
							<b>86,185.00</b>	

Unless otherwise indicated, the cover, binding and delivery charges are included in the main price.

d

**Arlington Heights Park District - 50# - Saddle Stitch**

Company	Season	50#	80# Text Wt. Cover	Saddle Stitch Binding	Delivery Chg	Total	Add'l 500 copies
KK Stevens Publishing Astoria, IL	Fall	20,799.96				20,799.96	\$233.92
	Winter	16,618.94				16,618.94	209.11
	Spring	18,464.07				18,464.07	182.94
	Summer	20,298.03				20,298.03	233.51
						<b>76,181.00</b>	
Action Printing Fon Dul Lac, WI	Fall	16,289.00				16,289.00	300.00
	Winter	13,636.00				13,636.00	260.00
	Spring	14,660.00				14,660.00	279.00
	Summer	16,289.00				16,289.00	300.00
						<b>60,874.00</b>	
American Litho Milwaukee, WI	Fall	20,748.00				20,748.00	252.00
	Winter	16,714.00				16,714.00	214.00
	Spring	18,272.00				18,272.00	230.00
	Summer	20,265.00				20,265.00	252.00
						<b>75,999.00</b>	
EP Graphics Berne, IN	Fall	24,592.00				24,592.00	260.77
	Winter	19,710.00				19,710.00	223.17
	Spring	21,592.00				21,592.00	238.30
	Summer	24,071.00				24,071.00	263.10
						<b>89,965.00</b>	
CSI Media Delavan, WI	Fall	15,313.00	8,296.00	4,488.00	500.00	28,597.00	135.00
	Winter	12,720.00				12,720.00	120.00
	Spring	14,028.00				14,028.00	124.00
	Summer	15,313.00				15,313.00	135.00
						<b>70,658.00</b>	
Castle Printech DeKalb, IL	Fall	19,235.00				19,235.00	150.00
	Winter	15,560.00				15,560.00	150.00
	Spring	17,215.00				17,215.00	150.00
	Summer	18,795.00				18,795.00	150.00
						<b>70,805.00</b>	

Unless otherwise indicated, the cover, binding and delivery charges are included in the main price.