
Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

06A-1 General Trades

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #1

Entry Trellis

Alternate #2

Southwest and 

Southeast Entrance 

Plaza

Alternate #3

Artificial Turf Seating 

Area

Alternate #5

Outfield Fencing 

Alternate #6

Artificial Turf 

Playground Surfacing

Alternate #8

Southern Drinking 
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Combination Bid Notes

Boller Construction 722,600.00$              42,100.00$                1,600.00$                  15,700.00$                18,400.00$                (1,800.00)$                 -$                           X X X X

Hargrave Builders 737,450.00$              25,500.00$                2,600.00$                  28,000.00$                20,000.00$                37,500.00$                -$                           X X X X

L.J. Morse Construction Company NO BID

Manusos General Contracting, Inc. 585,000.00$              17,295.00$                2,299.00$                  15,972.00$                19,950.00$                269,962.00$              4,411.00$                  X X X X

Landworks 808,445.00$              31,061.00$                3,400.00$                  12,965.00$                22,414.00$                (46,206.00)$               11,489.00$                X X X X

06A & 32F: 

$1,172,850



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

26A-1 Electrical

Trade Contractor   Base Bid A
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Combination Bid Notes

Apex3 Systems NO BID

Ascend Electric NO BID

Associated Electrical Contractors, LLC 398,860.00$               X X X X

Bassett Electrical Contracting 380,000.00$               X X X X

Carey Electric Contracting, Inc. 523,740.00$               X X X X

Kellenberger Electric, Inc. NO BID

MK Industries, Inc. 434,141.00$               X X X X

Peters Electric & Technology 325,643.00$               X X X X



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

31A-1 Excavation

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #2

Southwest and 

Southeast Entrance 

Plaza

Alternate #3

Artificial Turf Seating 

Area

Alternate #6

Artificial Turf 

Playground Surfacing

Alternate #7

Path Along Northwest 

Highway
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Combination Bid Notes

Alessio & Sons Company 558,000.00$               5,900.00$                   2,000.00$                   4,100.00$                   6,200.00$                   X X X X

31A&33A: 

$992,500.00

American Grading, Inc. NO BID

Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc. 379,000.00$               10,000.00$                 2,000.00$                   -$                            7,000.00$                   X X X X

DK Contractors, Inc. 440,468.00$               -$                            (332.00)$                     -$                            20,494.00$                 X X X X

J.S. Riemer, Inc. 392,000.00$               2,500.00$                   2,000.00$                   6,000.00$                   18,200.00$                 X X X X

31A&33A: 

$846,000.00

Kane County Excavating NO BID

Schneider Excavating 523,286.00$               5,010.00$                   900.00$                      1,200.00$                   42,600.00$                 X X X X

Stark & Son Trenching 340,847.00$               19,800.00$                 2,100.00$                   -$                            9,300.00$                   X X X X



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

32A-1 Asphalt Paving

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #2

Southwest and 

Southeast Entrance 

Plaza 

Alternate #7

Path Along Northwest 

Highway 
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Combination Bid Notes

Abbey Paving Co., Inc. 208,232.00$               (2,200.00)$                  (14,677.00)$                X X X X

32A&32C: 

$315,532.00

Accu-Paving Company 255,770.00$               -$                            44,150.00$                 X X X X

Alliance Contractors, Inc. NO BID

Chadwick Contracting Company 206,300.00$               (3,200.00)$                  24,600.00$                 X X X X

32A&32C: 

$360,700.00

Evans & Son Blacktop, Inc. NO BID

Everlast Blacktop NO BID

J.S. Riemer, Inc. NO BID

M & J Asphalt Paving (MJ Works) NO BID

Maneval Construction 223,450.00$               (2,945.00)$                  NOT LISTED No X X X

Obsidian Asphalt Paving 353,000.00$               -$                            36,000.00$                 X X X X

Troch-McNeil Paving Co., Inc. NO BID



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

32C-1 Site Concrete

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #2

Southwest and 

Southeast Entrance 

Plaza

Alternate #3

Artificial Turf Seating 

Area 

Alternate #4

Specialty Paving at 

Playground

Alternate #6

Artificial Turf 

Playground Surfacing
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Combination Bid Notes

Abbey Paving Co., Inc. 114,800.00$               29,300.00$                 2,275.00$                   7,225.00$                   450.00$                      X X X X

32A&32C: 

$315,532.00

Alliance Contractors, Inc. 247,405.00$               24,771.50$                 2,156.50$                   11,560.00$                 3,020.00$                   X X X X

Chadwick Contracting Company 156,900.00$               44,000.00$                 2,400.00$                   5,500.00$                   5,900.00$                   X X X X

32A&32C: 

$360,700.00

Elliot Construction Corporation 145,000.00$               86,530.00$                 12,500.00$                 15,000.00$                 2,000.00$                   X X X X

M & J Asphalt Paving (MJ Works) NO BID

Paul Herrera Construction Company 130,500.00$               29,100.00$                 2,150.00$                   5,850.00$                   2,800.00$                   X X X X

Troch-McNeil Paving Co., Inc. 131,600.00$               40,000.00$                 2,000.00$                   7,000.00$                   1,000.00$                   X X X X



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

32F-1 Landscaping

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #2

Southwest and 

Southeast Entrance 

Plaza

Alternate #3

Artificial Turf Seating 
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Alternate #7

Path Along Northwest 
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Combination Bid Notes

Balanced Environments Inc NO BID

Breezy Hill Landscaping, Inc. 222,300.00$               7,600.00$                   (220.00)$                     (2,600.00)$                  X X X X

George's Landscaping, Inc. NO BID

Innovation Landscape Inc. NO BID

Landworks, LTD 386,405.00$               14,000.00$                 (200.00)$                     5,460.00$                   X X X X

06A&32F: 

$1,172,850.00

Twin Oaks Landscaping NO BID



Arlington Heights Park District

Recreation Park - Phase 1

Thursday, May 23, 2024, at 1:00 PM

33A-1 Site Utilities

Trade Contractor   Base Bid 

Alternate #3

Artificial Turf Seating 

Area

Alternate #8

Southern Drinking 

Fountain 
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Combination Bid Notes

Alessio & Sons Company 470,500.00$               3,100.00$                   34,500.00$                 X X X X

31A&33A: 

$992,500.00

American Grading, Inc. 382,500.00$               2,000.00$                   24,500.00$                 X X X X

Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc. 393,000.00$               1,500.00$                   40,000.00$                 X X X X

DK Contractors, Inc. 371,823.00$               2,874.00$                   31,033.00$                 X X X X

J.S. Riemer, Inc. 459,000.00$               3,000.00$                   25,000.00$                 X X X X

Kane County Excavating NO BID

Maneval Construction NO BID

Stark & Son Trenching 345,917.00$               4,410.00$                   13,340.00$                 X X X X


